2/13/25			2/13/25	2/10/25		1/30/25	1/16/25	1/16/25		1/3/25	1/3/25	1/3/25	
Fed Aid LAP Design And Bray Road, Willard to Ormes Consultant Consultant Spicer Group, Inc	Vendor Esch Landscaping Inc Astec Asphalt, Inc	Primary Vendor Esch Landscaping Inc Astec Asphalt Inc	Hot Mixed Machine Patch Local Vendor Esch Landscaping Inc Astec Asphalt Inc	Hot Mixed Asphalt Bids	Alternates Farm Depot* 36 Month \$25,811.00 48 Month \$23,212.00 Tri County** 3 Units ***Tractors Only 3-Units Hutson****36 Month, 450 Hrs \$90,275.00 Co ****36 Month, 600 Hrs \$91,480.00 Cos *****JD Equip Only-3 units-Plan is comprehe deductible, 36-72 months 1,500-5,000 hours	Leased Tractor/Mower Bid Awarded to Tri County Vendor Tractor Make Farm Depot* Massey Ferguson 6713 Tri County Equip John Deere 5130M Janson Equip Co** Case IH Maxxum 145 Activ Hutson Inc John Deere 6M130	Hired Equipment	Cr. Gravel	Awarded to	Liquid Calcium Chloride	Concrete/Cement NO BID	Cold Patch Awarded to	Bids Extended for 202 <u>5</u> Roadside Spray-Dalton's Chipseal-Fahrner
Awarded to Spicer mes Cost for Design Package \$21,700.00 \$ \$60,000.00	Butt Joint(Ea) \$150.00 \$700.00	Mach. Patch Mi 0 to 5 \$550.00 \$830.00	Awarded in Bes Mach. Patch 0 to 5 \$450.00 \$790.00	Sent to Townships for Award	Alternates 48 Month \$25,811.00 48 Month \$23,212.00 Tri County** 3 Units ***Tractors Only 3-Units Hutson****36 Month, 450 Hrs \$90,275.00 Costs include ext. warr. Plan that can be removed to lower cost ********36 Month, 450 Hrs \$91,480.00 Costs include ext. warr. Plan that can be removed to lower cost ******36 Month, 600 Hrs \$91,480.00 Costs include ext. warr. Plan that can be removed to lower cost ************************************	id Awarded to Tri County Tractor Make Massey Ferguson 6713 John Deere 5130M Case IH Maxxum 145 Active Drive 4 Samasz KBRP250 John Deere 6M130 Diamond Mowers 1	Various equip/bidders	See Attached Awarded in Best I	Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales See Attached Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC	<u>Bidder</u> Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC	Unique Paving Materials Ajax Materials Corp Ace Saginaw Paving Co	<u>Bidder</u> Unique Paving Mate Ajax Materials Corp Ace Saginaw Pavir	Overband Crackseal-Fahrner Chloride Sand 24-25 Mark Martin Bidder
		Mach. Patch N 5 to 10 \$395.00 \$ \$720.00 \$	9	for Award		e Drive 4		nterest of TCR		Sales, LLC		erials o ng Co	
	HMA Surf. Removal (SqYd) \$75.00 \$3.00	Mach. Patch Ma 10 to 50 \$350.00 \$460.00	Mach. Patch Mi 10 to 50 \$300.00 \$410.00		rarr. Plan that ca arr. Plan that ca , 2,000 hours, \$	Mower Make/Model Samasz KBRP250 Diamond RSF075-C Samasz KBRP250 Samasz KBRP250 Diamond Mowers 75" Rear S	\warded in Bes		\$.687 p/gal	Continuous No Bid		UPM Cold Mix UPM UPM QPR	Cr. Shape Stab-Pvmt Recyc Pavement Marking Extended to M&M
	- 1	Mach. Patch A 25 to 50 5 \$325.00 \$380.00	Mach. Patch N 25 to 50 5 \$285.00 \$335.00		n be removed n be removed 250 ded @ \$3	Model .C .F' Rear S	t interest of		gal	d		Mix	Pvmt Recyc ing Extendec
	Cold Milling (1/2) Day Lump Sum \$5,450.00 \$4,000.00	Mach. Patch Skip Patch> 50 50 & Over \$245.00 \$225.00 \$299.00 \$350.00	Mach. Patch Skip Patch> 50 50 & Over \$275.00 \$190.00 \$280.00 \$320.00		to lower cost to lower cost to lower cost ,706 per unit. Pla	Ann Lease Tract & Mower 12 Mth Opt Ext \$25,811.00 \$5,300 \$27,300.00 \$1,776.00 \$92,862.18 \$29,790.00 Alternates**** \$11,118.00**	Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC As Needed		\$.697 p/gal	Intermittent No Bid		Price Per Ton \$132.20 \$135.75 \$129.95	
	1				ans range 250-5	Mower 12 Mth C \$5 \$1,7 \$29,7 \$11,1	<u>u</u>			Road Commission No Bid			
	Cold Mill, Whole Day Lump Sum \$8,600.00 \$6,500.00	Skip Patch<50 \$245.00 \$350.00	Skip Patch<50 \$210.00 \$320.00		,,000	2 Mth Opt Ext Warr \$5,300 \$1,776.00 \$29,790.00*** \$11,118.00*****			N/A	mmission Pickup No Bid			
									1-2 Days	Max Time Span N/A			

Source of Material Described Dist Veh
N/A
N/A
Pressure
Applied, Pos
Oxy Chem Co
Displacement

2/27/25

3/13/25

3/13/25

Pyramid Paving

Astec Asphalt

3/13/25

2/27/25

2/27/25